Jie Ming Mandarin Immersion Addition and Renovation - South Lot



WORK SCOPE: 32B - Site Concrete

	TOTAL BID: LOW SUB: 3 Bids Received		SUBCONTRACTOR:	Curb Masters Inc.	North Country Concrete	Stapf Concrete Construction		
			SELECT BIDDER?:	SELECT BIDDER?:				
			ORIGINAL BASE BID:	\$ 174,740.00	\$ 163,200.00	\$ 143,700.00	\$-	\$ -
	Reference	General Scope Items						
1	Bid Security			EXCLUDED	EXCLUDED	EXCLUDED		
2	Addenda Ackno	owledged		INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED		
3	MN Responsibl	le Contractor Form		INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED		
			ADJUSTED BASE BID	\$174,740.00	\$163,200.00	\$143,700.00		
				3	2	1		

Alternates		Selected Low Bidder: Alternate	Curb Masters Inc.		North Country Concrete	Stapf Concrete Construction	No Bid	No Bid	
ALT #1	Omit decorative fence, concrete footings and concrete maintenance strip. Plantings to remain in Scope. Provide spade cut edge at edge of mulched area.		\$ (4,2	242.00)	\$-	\$ (4,000.00)	\$-	\$-	
ADJUSTED BASE BID WITH ALTERNATES				498.00	\$ 163,200.00	\$ 139,700.00			

	Unit Prices	Selected Low Bidder: Unit Prices	Curb Masters Inc.	North Country Concrete		Stapf Concrete Construction	No Bid	No Bid	
Unit Price #1	Provide a cost per Ton to remove Regulated Soils from site as directed by Geotechnical Engineer.		\$-	\$	-	\$-	\$-	\$-	
Unit Price #2	Provide a cost per Cubic Yard to remove Unregulated Soils from site as directed by Geotechnical Engineer.		\$-	\$	-	\$-	\$-	\$-	
Unit Price #3	Provide a cost per Cubic Yard to add satisfactory replacement soil to site as directed by Geotechnical Engineer		\$-	\$	-	\$-	\$-	\$-	
Unit Price #4	Provide a cost per Ton to remove buried concrete or masonry that cannot be reused Regulated Soils from site as directed by Geotechnical Engineer.		\$-	\$	-	\$-	\$-	\$-	
ADJUSTED BASE BID + UNIT PRICES			\$ 174,740.00	\$	163,200.00	\$ 143,700.00			
ADJUSTED BASE BID + ALTERNATES + UNIT PRICES) \$	163,200.00	\$ 139,700.00	#VALUE!	#VALUE!	

March 7, 2023 at 2:00 PM